

RECEIVED
16 FEB 2022
BAGUIO CITY

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
(Goods and Services)
Baguio City
ABSTRACT OF QUOTATIONS

Abstract of Bids or quotations under Circular Proposal No. **NP 9** dated January 19, 2021 and opened on January 31, 2022
PR #: 2022-5010 OBR #: 101-9940-22-01-06 CONT

Item	QTY	Unit	Description	ABC ITEM	ABC Total	WISENHEIMER TRADING			MLG GREEN HOUSE PHARMACEUTICAL TRADING		
						Unit Cost	Amount	Remarks	Unit Cost	Amount	Remarks
1	1	LOT	MEDICINES								
	10000	pcs	ACETYLCYSTEINE 600mg Effervescent tablet	39.60	1,914,100.00	31.88	676,600.00 318,800.00	Flucysteine 600 Powder sachet	20.88	593,400.00 208,800.00	Flumucil
	10000	pcs	AZITHROMYCIN 500mg Tablet (as Base/ as Dihydrates/ as Monohydrates)	123.00		21.88	218,800.00	Azimin by 3's	20.90	209,000.00	Generic
	20000	pcs	ASCORBIC ACID 500mg Tablet	2.68		0.98	19,600.00	Better-C	0.79	15,800.00	Generic
	10000	pcs	BUTAMIRATE as Citrate, tablet 50 mg	16.00		7.88	78,800.00	Nysecod	13.12	131,200.00	Generic
	10000	pcs	AMLODIINE 5mg/tablet (as Besilate/Camsylate)	3.30		0.88	8,800.00	Lopidex	0.51	5,100.00	Generic
	10000	pcs	LAGUNDI Vitex Negundo L, 600mg tablet	4.15		3.18	31,800.00		2.35	23,500.00	Generic
			Source of Funding: COVID Philhealth Cont. Fund								
			Purpose: Medicines for use of Baguio City Community Isolation Unit and Baguio Teacher's Camp Isolation c/o HSO Bidders								
			WISENHEIMER TRADING								
			MLG GREEN HOUSE PHARMACEUTICAL TRADING								
	1 of 5										
							FAILED. DID NOT MEET SPECS			PASSED.	

Item

Awarded to:
1 **MED-LINE
DISTRIBUTOR**

ATTY. LETICIA O. CLEMENTE
City Budget Officer
& BAC Chairperson

ATTY. RHEENING S. DIWAS
City Environment and Parks Management Officer
& BAC Member

MR. EUGENE D. BUYUGAN
City General Services Officer
& BAC Vice Chair Person

ATTY. ALTHEA ROSANNA V. ALBERTO
Executive Assistant IV
& BAC Member

DR. SIGARDO B. BESTED
D.V.N, Assistant City Veterinarian
& BAC Member

ATTY. RICHARD G. DAYAG
City Legal Officer
& BAC Member

ROWENA P. GALPO, MD, MPH
City Health Officer
End-user

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

(Goods and Services)

Baguio City

ABSTRACT OF QUOTATIONS

Abstract of Bids or quotations under Circular Proposal No.

NP 9

dated

January 19, 2021

and opened on January 31, 2022

PR #: 2022-5010

OBR #: 101-9940-22-01-06 CONT

Item	QTY	Unit	Description	ABC ITEM	ABC Total	GREENWATER RENNAISSANCE CORPORATION			SOBIMED PHARMACEUTICALS				
						Unit Cost	Amount	Remarks	Unit Cost	Amount	Remarks		
1	1	LOT	MEDICINES										
			10000	pcs	ACETYLCYSTEINE 600mg Effervescent tablet	39.60	1,914,100.00	0.00	175,400.00 0.00	N / A	29.50	750,000.00 295,000.00	Flumucil
			10000	pcs	AZITHROMYCIN 500mg Tablet (as Base/ as Dihydrates/ as Monohydrates)	123.00		0.00	0.00	N / A	25.00	250,000.00	Yuromaxiu
			20000	pcs	ASCORBIC ACID 500mg Tablet	2.68		6.36	127,200.00		1.50	30,000.00	Vitcee
			10000	pcs	BUTAMIRATE as Citrate, tablet 50 mg	16.00		0.00	0.00	N / A	13.00	130,000.00	Cofmed
			10000	pcs	AMLODIINE 5mg/tablet (as Besilate/Camsylate)	3.30		4.82	48,200.00		1.50	15,000.00	Diadipine
			10000	pcs	LAGUNDI Vitex Negundo L, 600mg tablet	4.15		0.00	0.00	N / A	3.00	30,000.00	Ofplemed
			Source of Funding: COVID Philhealth Cont. Fund										
			Purpose: Medicines for use of Baguio City Community Isolation Unit and Baguio Teacher's Camp Isolation c/o HSO										
			Bidders GREENWATER RENNAISSANCE CORPORATION				FAILED. INCOMPLETE BID OFFER				PASSED.		
			SOBIMED PHARMACEUTICALS										
		2 of 5											

Item

Awarded to:

**1 MED-LINE
DISTRIBUTOR**

ATTY. LETICIA O. CLEMENTE

City Budget Officer
& BAC Chairperson

MR. EUGENE B. BUYUCAN

City General Services Officer
& BAC Vice Chair Person

DR. SIJARDO B. BESTED

D.V.N, Assistant City Veterinarian
& BAC Member

ROWENA P. GALPO, MD, MPH

City Health Officer
End-user

ATTY. RHERAN G. DIWAS

City Environment and Parks Management Officer
& BAC Member

ATTY. ALTHEA ROSANNA V. ALBERTO

Executive Assistant IV
& BAC Member

ATTY. RICHARD G. DAYAG

City Legal Officer
& BAC Member

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

(Goods and Services)

Baguio City

ABSTRACT OF QUOTATIONS

Abstract of Bids or quotations under Circular Proposal No.

NP 9

dated

January 19, 2021

and opened on January 31, 2022

PR #: 2022-5010

OBR #: 101-9940-22-01-06 CONT

Item	QTY	Unit	Description	ABC ITEM	ABC Total	LOYOSEN'S ENTERPRISE			PHIL PHARMAWEALTH, INC.		
						Unit Cost	Amount	Remarks	Unit Cost	Amount	Remarks
1	1	LOT	MEDICINES								
	10000	pcs	ACETYLCYSTEINE 600mg Effervescent tablet	39.60	1,914,100.00	39.60	1,500,800.00 396,000.00	Flucystine / Generic	0.00	978,900.00 0.00	No Bid
	10000	pcs	AZITHROMYCIN 500mg Tablet (as Base/ as Dihydrates/ as Monohydrates)	123.00		88.00	880,000.00	Azithrom	95.00	950,000.00	Trozin
	20000	pcs	ASCORBIC ACID 500mg Tablet	2.68		0.75	15,000.00	Vonwelt / Enoce / Ascophil	0.00	0.00	No Bid
	10000	pcs	BUTAMIRATE as Citrate, tablet 50 mg	16.00		16.00	160,000.00		0.00	0.00	No Bid
	10000	pcs	AMLODIINE 5mg/tablet (as Besilate/Camsylate)	3.30		1.00	10,000.00	Besilate / Vonwelt	2.89	28,900.00	Amdipine
	10000	pcs	LAGUNDI Vitex Negundo L, 600mg tablet	4.15		3.98	39,800.00	Aflemel / Asflem	0.00	0.00	No Bid
			Source of Funding: COVID Philhealth Cont. Fund								
			Purpose: Medicines for use of Baguio City Community Isolation Unit and Baguio Teacher's Camp Isolation c/o HSO Bidders								
			LOYOSEN'S ENTERPRISE								
			PHIL PHARMAWEALTH, INC.								
	3 of 5										

PASSED.

**FAILED.
INCOMPLETE
BID OFFER**

Item

Awarded to:

**1 MED-LINE
DISTRIBUTOR**

ATTY. LENCIA O. CLEMENTE

City Budget Officer
& BAC Chairperson

MR. EUGENE D. BUYUCAN

City General Services Officer
& BAC Vice Chair Person

DR. SILARDO B. BESTED

D.V.N. Assistant City Veterinarian
& BAC Member

ROWENA P. GALPO, MD, MPH

City Health Officer
End-user

ATTY. RHENAN G. DIWAS

City Environment and Parks Management Officer
& BAC Member

ATTY. ALTHEA ROSANNA V. ALBERTO

Executive Assistant IV
& BAC Member

ATTY. RICHARD G. DAYAG

City Legal Officer
& BAC Member

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
 (Goods and Services)
 Baguio City
ABSTRACT OF QUOTATIONS

Abstract of Bids or quotations under Circular Proposal No.

NP 9

dated

January 19, 2021

and opened on January 31, 2022

PR #: 2022-5010

OBR #: 101-9940-22-01-06 CONT

Item	QTY	Unit	Description	ABC ITEM	ABC Total	ZYMED MEDICAL DISTRIBUTORS			Unit Cost	Amount	Remarks
						Unit Cost	Amount	Remarks			
1	1	LOT	MEDICINES								
	10000	pcs	ACETYLCYSTEINE 600mg Effervescent tablet	39.60	1,914,100.00	35.00	743,700.00 350,000.00			Ultrinac	
	10000	pcs	AZITHROMYCIN 500mg Tablet (as Base/ as Dihydrates/ as Monohydrates)	123.00		24.50	245,000.00			Generic / Azitrom	
	20000	pcs	ASCORBIC ACID 500mg Tablet	2.68		0.80	16,000.00			Generic / Enocee	
	10000	pcs	BUTAMIRATE as Citrate, tablet 50 mg	16.00		9.62	96,200.00			Generic / Anticuf	
	10000	pcs	AMLODIINE 5mg/tablet (as Besilate/Camsylate)	3.30		0.85	8,500.00			Generic / Lodipex	
	10000	pcs	LAGUNDI Vitex Negundo L, 600mg tablet	4.15		2.80	28,000.00			Ofimed / Megacof / Generic	
			Source of Funding: COVID Philhealth Cont. Fund								
			Purpose: Medicines for use of Baguio City Community Isolation Unit and Baguio Teacher's Camp Isolation c/o HSO								
			Bidders ZYMED MEDICAL DISTRIBUTORS								
	5 of 5										

PASSED.

Item

Awarded to:

**1 MED-LINE
DISTRIBUTOR**

ATTY. LETICIA O. CLEMENTE

City Budget Officer
& BAC Chairperson

MR. EUGENE D. BUYUCAN

City General Services Officer
& BAC Vice Chair Person

DR. SILARDO P. BESTED

D.V.N, Assistant City Veterinarian
& BAC Member

ROWENA P. GALPO, MD, MPH

City Health Officer
End-user

ATTY. RHEMAN S. DIWAS

City Environment and Parks Management Officer
& BAC Member

ATTY. ALTHEA ROSANNA V. ALBERTO*

Executive Assistant IV
& BAC Member

ATTY. RICHARD G. DAYAG

City Legal Officer
& BAC Member