

Republic of the Philippines
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
 (Goods and Services)
 Baguio City



Abstract of Bid or quotation under Circular Proposal No. **SVP 1064**, Project ID: 32359, PR No:1161 opened on **Sep 17, 2021** and date prepared **Sep 19, 2021**

Item 9.28	QTY	Unit	Description	ABC ITEM	ABC Total	CAB ONE FOODS			DADS PLACE TRANSIENT HOUSE AND RESIDENCE		
						Unit Cost	Amount	Remarks	Unit Cost	Amount	Remarks
1	1	Lot	Snacks- FMC c/o OCSWDO	3,600.00	3,600.00	0.00			3,330.00		
	15	pax	- Snacks for Committee meetings on October 8, 2021. Menu: Ginataang bilo-bilo, 240 ml canned Fruit Juice.	80.00	1,200.00	0.00	0.00	No bid submitted	74.00	1,110.00	Orange Juice Del Monte
	15	pax	- Snacks for Committee meetings on September 24, 2021. Menu: Native Kakanin, 240 ml canned Fruit Juice.	80.00	1,200.00	0.00	0.00	No bid submitted	74.00	1,110.00	4 Seasons, Del Monte
	15	pax	- Snacks for Committee meetings on September 29, 2021. Menu: Chicken Sandwich, 240 ml canned Fruit Juice.	80.00	1,200.00	0.00	0.00	No bid submitted	74.00	1,110.00	Pineapple Juice Del Monte
			Purpose: Snacks for the 3 committee meetings for the Family Month Celebration on September 24, 29 and October 8, 2021.								
			Bidders CAB ONE FOODS DADS PLACE TRANSIENT HOUSE AND RESIDENCE								
						Failed			Passed		

Item
1 Lot

Awarded to:

DADS PLACE TRANSIENT HOUSE AND RESIDENCE

ATTY. LETICIA O. CLEMENTE
 City Budget Officer
 & BAC Chairperson

MR. EUGENE D. BUYUCAN
 City General Services Officer
 & BAC Vice Chair Person

DR. SILARDO B. BESTED
 D.V.N, Assistant City Veterinarian
 & BAC Member

Ms. Betty F. Pangasan
 City Social Welfare And Development Officer
 & Enduser

ATTY. RHENAN G. DIWAS
 City Environment and Parks Management Officer
 & BAC Member

ATTY. ALTHEA ROSANNA V. ALBERTO
 Executive Assistant IV
 & BAC Member

ATTY. RICHARD C. BAYAG
 OTC City Legal Officer
 & BAC Member

Item	QTY	Unit	Description	ABC ITEM	ABC Total	GABLETS CATERING SERVICES		
						Unit Cost	Amount	Remarks
1	1	Lot	Snacks- FMC c/o OCSWDO	3,600.00	3,600.00	0.00		
	15	pax	- Snacks for Committee meetings on October 8, 2021. Menu: Ginataang bilo-bilo, 240 ml canned Fruit Juice.	80.00	1,200.00	0.00	0.00	No bid submitted
	15	pax	- Snacks for Committee meetings on September 24, 2021. Menu: Native Kakanin, 240 ml canned Fruit Juice.	80.00	1,200.00	0.00	0.00	No bid submitted
	15	pax	- Snacks for Committee meetings on September 29, 2021. Menu: Chicken Sandwich, 240 ml canned Fruit Juice.	80.00	1,200.00	0.00	0.00	No bid submitted
			Purpose: Snacks for the 3 committee meetings for the Family Month Celebration on September 24, 29 and October 8, 2021.					
			Bidders GABLETS CATERING SERVICES					
						Failed		

Item
1 Lot

Awarded to:

DADS PLACE TRANSIENT HOUSE AND RESIDENCE

ATTY. LETICIA O. CLEMENTE

City Budget Officer
& BAC Chairperson

MR. EUGENE D. BUYUCAN

City General Services Officer
& BAC Vice Chair Person

DR. SILVARDO B. BESTED

D.V.N, Assistant City Veterinarian
& BAC Member

Ms. Betty B. Pangasan

City Social Welfare And Development Officer
& Enduser

ATTY. RHEMAN G. DIWAS

City Environment and Parks Management Officer
& BAC Member

ATTY. ALTHEA ROSANNA V. ALBERTO

Executive Assistant IV
& BAC Member

ATTY. RICHARD G. DAYAG

City Legal Officer
& BAC Member