

Republic of the Philippines
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
 (Goods and Services)
 Baguio City




Abstract of Bid or quotation under Circular Proposal No. SVP 296, Project ID: 38559, PR No:91 opened on Apr 13, 2022 and date prepared Apr 14, 2022


Item	QTY	Unit	Description	ABC ITEM	ABC Total	Larry's Airconditioning and Engineering Services			C.M.L AUTO REPAIR SHOP		
						Unit Cost	Amount	Remarks	Unit Cost	Amount	Remarks
1	1	Lot	RM Vehicle - SAA 9772 c/o BCPO	16,760.00	16,760.00	16,760.00			20,460.00		
	1	lot	- Labor	3,100.00	3,100.00	3,100.00	3,100.00		4,500.00	4,500.00	
	2	piece	- Shock absorber (Brandnew/Replacement)	4,800.00	9,600.00	4,800.00	9,600.00	KYB	5,200.00	10,400.00	
	2	piece	- Stab link (Brandnew/Replacement)	1,580.00	3,160.00	1,580.00	3,160.00	555	1,780.00	3,560.00	
	2	piece	LUMP/LOT - Stab clamp bushing (Brandnew/Replacement)	450.00	900.00	450.00	900.00		1,000.00	2,000.00	
			Purpose: For repair and tires replacement of Hyundai (Elantra) mobile with plate number SAA 9772 of PS 3, BCPO.								
			Bidders Larry's Airconditioning and Engineering Services C.M.L AUTO REPAIR SHOP								
						Passed			Failed		
						Above ABC					


Item
1 Lot


Awarded to:

Larry's Airconditioning and Engineering Services



 April 18, 2022
ATTY. LETICIA O. CLEMENTE
 City Budget Officer
 & BAC Chairperson



 April 18, 2022
MR. EUGENE D. BUYUCAN
 City General Services Officer
 & BAC Vice Chair Person


 April 18, 2022
DR. SILARDO B. BESTED
 D.V.M, City Veterinarian
 & BAC Member


 April 18, 2022
PCOL. Glenn D. Lonogan
 City Director
 & Enduser


 April 18, 2022
ATTY. RHENAN G. DIWAS
 City Environment and Parks Management Officer
 & BAC Member


 April 18, 2022
ATTY. ALTHEA ROSANNA V. ALBERTO
 Executive Assistant IV
 & BAC Member


 April 18, 2022
ATTY. RICHARD G. DAYAG
 City Legal Officer
 & BAC Member

Item	QTY	Unit	Description	ABC ITEM	ABC Total	JSD AUTOSPORT PARTS TRADING & SERVICES			
						Unit Cost	Amount	Remarks	
1	1	Lot	RM Vehicle - SAA 9772 c/o BCPO	16,760.00	16,760.00	0.00			
	1	lot	- Labor	3,100.00	3,100.00	0.00	0.00	No bid submitted	
	2	piece	- Shock absorber (Brandnew/Replacement)	4,800.00	9,600.00	0.00	0.00	No bid submitted	
	2	piece	- Stab link (Brandnew/Replacement)	1,580.00	3,160.00	0.00	0.00	No bid submitted	
	2	piece	LUMP/LOT - Stab clamp bushing (Brandnew/Replacement)	450.00	900.00	0.00	0.00	No bid submitted	
			Purpose: For repair and tires replacement of Hyundai (Elantra) mobile with plate number SAA 9772 of PS 3, BCPO.						
			Bidders JSD AUTOSPORT PARTS TRADING & SERVICES						
								Failed	

Item
1 Lot

Awarded to:
Larry's Airconditioning and Engineering Services



April 18, 2022
ATTY. LETICIA O. CLEMENTE
City Budget Officer
& BAC Chairperson



April 18, 2022
MR. EUGENE D. BUYUCAN
City General Services Officer
& BAC Vice Chair Person



April 18, 2022
DR. SILARDO B. BESTED
D.V.M, City Veterinarian
& BAC Member



April 18, 2022
PCOL. Glenn D. Lonogan
City Director
& Enduser



April 18, 2022
ATTY. RHENAN G. DIWAS
City Environment and Parks Management Officer
& BAC Member



April 18, 2022
ATTY. ALTHEA ROSANNA V. ALBERTO
Executive Assistant IV
& BAC Member



April 18, 2022
ATTY. RICHARD G. DAYAG
City Legal Officer
& BAC Member