Republic of the Philippines
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
(Goods and Services)
Baguio City

Abstract of Bid or quotation under Circular Proposal No. SVP 433, Project ID: 39415, PR No:99 opened on Mar 23, 2022 and date prepared Mar 24, 2022

a

Item | QTY | Unit | Description ABC ABC Total | TOP ACE MOTOR WORKS CORP., WUERTH PHILIPPINES, INC.
ITEM INC.
Unit Cost | Amount Remarks | UnitCost | Amount Remarks
1 1 Lot RM Single Drum Thermoplastic Machine c/o CEO 88,000.00 | 88,000.00 88,000.00 100,000.00
1 lot Repair of Single Drum Thermoplastic Machine - Labor and Materials - 1. Replace old diesel Engine to brand new Kubota RK710 diesel 70,000.00 | 70,000.00 | 70,000.00 | 70,000.00 78,000.00 | 78,000.00
engine, 7 PS Power
1 lot Repair of Single Drum Thermoplastic Machine - Labor and Materials - 2. Fabrication of diesel Engine pedestal and mounting to thermoplastic 8,000.00 8,000.00 8,000.00 8,000.00 10,000.00 | 10,000.00
premelter
1 lot Repair of Single Drum Thermoplastic Machine - Labor and Materials - 3. Fabrication and installatin of coupling mechanism of Engine shaft to 6,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 65,000.00 6,000.00 6,000.00
premelter agitator
1 lot Repair of Single Drum Thermoplastic Machine - Labor and Materials - 4. Fabricate and install wheel brake mechanism for applicator machine | 5,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 6,000.00 6,000.00
Purpose: To payment for the expenses incurred for the Repair of Single Drum Thermoplastic Machine - Labar and Materials (Working Period
- 30 days) c/o CEO
Bidders
TOP ACE MOTOR WORKS CORP,, INC.
WUERTH PHILIPPINES, INC.
Passed Failed
Above ABC
item -
f Lot /,——4/- 7@=‘ /ﬂ/‘* @
Awarded to: March 25, 2022 March 28, 2022 March 25, 2022 March 25, 2022
ATTY. LETICIA O. CLEMENTE MR. EUGENE D. BUYUCAN DR. SILARDO B. BESTED Engr. Edgar Victorio R. Olpindo
TOR . .
TOF ACE MOTORSOSKSICORR. ¢ City Budget Officer City General Services Officer D.V.N, Assistant City Veterinarian City Engineer
& BAC Chalrperson & BAC Vice Chair Person & BAC Member & Enduser
March 25, 2022 March 28, 2022 March 25, 2022
ATTY. RHENAN G. DIWAS ATTY. ALTHEA ROSANNA V. ALBERTO ATTY. RICHARD G. DAYAG
City Environment and Parks Management Officer Executive Assistant IV City Legal Officer
& BAC Member & BAC Member & BAC Member




ltem | QTY | Unit | Description ABC ABC Total | SPECIAL STAGE AUTO SUPPLY &
ITEM ACCESORIES
Unit Cost Amount Remarks
1 1 Lot RM Single Drum Thermoplastic Machine c/fo CEO 88,000.00 | 88,000.00 0.00
1 lot Repair of Single Drum Thermoplastic Machine - Labor and Materials - 1. Replace old diese! Engine to brand new Kubota RK710 70,000.00 | 70,000.00 | 0.00 0.00 No Bid
diesel engine, 7 PS Power
1 lot Repair of Single Drum Thermoplastic Machine - Labor and Materials - 2, Fabrication of diesel Engine pedestal and mounting to 8,000.00 8,000.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid
thermoplastic premelter
1 lot Repair of Single Drum Thermoplastic Machine - Labor and Materials - 3. Fabrication and installatin of coupling mechanism of 5,000.00 5,000.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid
Engine shaft to premelter agitator
1 lot Repair of Single Drum Thermoplastic Machine - Labor and Materials - 4. Fabricate and install wheel brake mechanism for 5,000.00 5,000.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid
applicator machine
Purpose: To payment for the expenses incurred for the Repair of Single Drum Thermoplastic Machine - Labor and Materials
(Working Period - 30 days) ¢c/o CEO
Bidders
SPECIAL STAGE AUTO SUPPLY & ACCESORIES
Failed
ltem -
1 Lot /b___ﬁ @ e @
Awarded to:

TOP ACE MOTOR WORKS CORP., INC.

March 25, 2022
ATTY. LETICIA O. CLEMENTE
City Budget Officer
& BAC Chairperson

March 28, 2022

MR. EUGENE D. BUYUCAN
City General Services Officer

& BAC Vice Chair Person

March 25, 2022

ATTY. RHENAN G. DIWAS
City Environment and Parks Management Officer

& BAC Member

March 25, 2022
DR. SILARDO B, BESTED
D.V.N, Assistant City Veterinarian
& BAC Member

March 28, 2022
ATTY. ALTHEA ROSANNA V. ALBERTO

Executive Assistant IV
& BAC Member

March 25, 2022
Engr. Edgar Victorio R. Olpindo
City Engineer
& Enduser

I

March 25, 2022
ATTY. RICHARD G. DAYAG
City Legal Officer
& BAC Member



