

Republic of the Philippines
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
 (Goods and Services)
 Baguio City



Abstract of Bid or quotation under Circular Proposal No. **SVP 54, Project ID: 37332, PR No.:5** opened on **Jan 20, 2022** and date prepared **Jan 20, 2022**

Item	QTY	Unit	Description	ABC ITEM	ABC Total	PINDER ART AND DESIGN STUDIO			GOLD INK PRINTING SHOP					
						Unit Cost	Amount	Remarks	Unit Cost	Amount	Remarks			
1	1	Lot	Trophies for Bible Quiz Bee c/o HRMO	15,000.00	15,000.00									
2	2	piece	TROPHY - Trophies for the 1st runner up of the Bible Quiz Bee for Elementary Category and Junior High Category on January 28, 2022 at DEPED Conference Hall, Baguio City. Specs: Size: 10.5" x 13" Materials: Wood, Resin, Cloth, Glass Text: Please see attached. Note: For the winning bidder to coordinate with the end user on the final text to be put in the trophies. Please see attached sample. Thank you.	2,500.00	5,000.00	2,000.00	4,000.00		0.00	0.00	No bid submitted			
			TROPHY - Trophies for the 2nd runner up of the Bible Quiz Bee for Elementary Category and Junior High Category on January 28, 2022 at DEPED Conference Hall, Baguio City. Specs: Size: 10.5" x 13" Materials: Wood, Resin, Cloth, Glass Text: Please see attached. Note: For the winning bidder to coordinate with the end user on the final text to be put in the trophies. Please see attached sample. Thank you.	2,500.00	5,000.00	2,000.00	4,000.00		0.00	0.00	No bid submitted			
2	2	piece	TROPHY - Trophies for the Champion of the Bible Quiz Bee for Elementary Category and Junior High Category on January 28, 2022 at DEPED Conference Hall, Baguio City. Specs: Size: 10.5" x 13" Materials: Wood, Resin, Cloth, Glass Text: Please see attached. Note: For the winning bidder to coordinate with the end user on the final text to be put in the trophies. Please see attached sample. Thank you.	2,500.00	5,000.00	2,000.00	4,000.00		0.00	0.00	No bid submitted			
Purpose: Payment of Trophies of the Winners in the Bible Quiz Bee for Elementary Category and Junior High Category on January 28, 2022 at DEPED, Conference Hall, Baguio City Bidders PINDER ART AND DESIGN STUDIO GOLD INK PRINTING SHOP														
Passed						Failed								

Item	QTY	Unit	Description	ABC ITEM	ABC Total	PINDER ART AND DESIGN STUDIO			GOLD INK PRINTING SHOP		
						Unit Cost	Amount	Remarks	Unit Cost	Amount	Remarks

Item
1 Lot

Awarded to:

PINDER ART AND DESIGN STUDIO

January 25, 2022
ATTY. LETICIA O. CLEMENTE
 City Budget Officer
 & BAC Chairperson



January 27, 2022
MR. EUGENE D. BUYUCAN
 City General Services Officer
 & BAC Vice Chair Person



January 26, 2022
ATTY. RHENAN G. DIVAS
 City Environment and Parks Management Officer
 & BAC Member



January 25, 2022
DR. SILARDO B. BESTED
 D.V.N, Assistant City Veterinarian
 & BAC Member



January 31, 2022
ATTY. ALTHEA ROSANNA V. ALBERTO
 Executive Assistant IV
 & BAC Member



January 25, 2022
Atty. Augustin P. Laban III
 City Human Resource Management Officer
 & Enduser



January 25, 2022
ATTY. RICHARD G. DAYAG
 City Legal Officer
 & BAC Member



Item	QTY	Unit	Description	ABC ITEM	ABC Total	MONT BLANC STOREHOUSE ENTERPRISE		
						Unit Cost	Amount	Remarks
1	1	Lot	Trophies for Bible Quiz Bee c/o HRMO	15,000.00	15,000.00			
2	2	piece	TROPHY - Trophies for the 1st runner up of the Bible Quiz Bee for Elementary Category and Junior High Category on January 28, 2022 at DEPED Conference Hall, Baguio City. Specs: Size: 10.5" x 13" Materials: Wood, Resin, Cloth, Glass Text: Please see attached. Note: For the winning bidder to coordinate with the end user on the final text to be put in the trophies. Please see attached sample. Thank you.	2,500.00	5,000.00	0.00	0.00	No bid submitted
2	2	piece	TROPHY - Trophies for the 2nd runner up of the Bible Quiz Bee for Elementary Category and Junior High Category on January 28, 2022 at DEPED Conference Hall, Baguio City. Specs: Size: 10.5" x 13" Materials: Wood, Resin, Cloth, Glass Text: Please see attached. Note: For the winning bidder to coordinate with the end user on the final text to be put in the trophies. Please see attached sample. Thank you.	2,500.00	5,000.00	0.00	0.00	No bid submitted
			<p>Purpose: Payment of Trophies of the Winners in the Bible Quiz Bee for Elementary Category and Junior High Category on January 28, 2022 at DEPED, Conference Hall, Baguio City</p> <p>Bidders MONT BLANC STOREHOUSE ENTERPRISE</p>					
								Failed

Item
1 Lot


Awarded to:


January 25, 2022

ATTY. LETICIA O. CLEMENTE
 City Budget Officer
 & BAC Chairperson

January 27, 2022


MR. EUGENE D. BUYUGAN
 City General Services Officer
 & BAC Vice Chair Person


January 25, 2022

DR. SILARDO B. BESTED
 D.V.N, Assistant City Veterinarian
 & BAC Member

January 25, 2022

Atty. Augustin P. Laban III
 City Human Resource Management Officer
 & Enduser

January 26, 2022

ATTY. RHENAN G. DIVAS
 City Environment and Parks Management Officer
 & BAC Member

January 31, 2022

ATTY. ALTHEA ROSANNA V. ALBERTO
 Executive Assistant IV
 & BAC Member

January 25, 2022

ATTY. RICHARD G. DAYAG
 City Legal Officer
 & BAC Member

PINDER ART AND DESIGN STUDIO