

Republic of the Philippines
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
 (Goods and Services)
 Baguio City



Abstract of Bid or quotation under Circular Proposal No. **SVP 55, Project ID: 37310, PR No:12** opened on **Jan 21, 2022** and date prepared **Jan 23, 2022**

| Item | QTY | Unit | Description | ABC ITEM | ABC Total | MALYKA INTERNATIONAL TRADING INC. | | | MONES DENTAL LABORATORY | | |
|------|-----|-------|---|------------|------------|-----------------------------------|-----------|------------------------|-------------------------|--------|------------------|
| | | | | | | Unit Cost | Amount | Remarks | Unit Cost | Amount | Remarks |
| 1 | 1 | Lot | Dental supplies c/o HSO | 245,215.00 | 245,215.00 | 170,400.00 | | | 0.00 | | |
| | 25 | piece | Dental Elevator - Size: Medium Shape, Type: Straight | 460.00 | 11,500.00 | 350.00 | 8,750.00 | Surdent (German Steel) | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 25 | box | Dental Needle - Gauge 30 | 728.00 | 18,200.00 | 450.00 | 11,250.00 | Surdent (German Steel) | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 25 | box | Dental Needle - Hypodermic Needle Disposable, 27G 1/2inch (0.40x13mm) | 437.00 | 10,925.00 | 380.00 | 9,500.00 | Surdent (German Steel) | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 50 | piece | Dental Syringe - 1.8ml Self Aspirating Dental Syringe | 575.00 | 28,750.00 | 400.00 | 20,000.00 | Surdent (German Steel) | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 50 | set | Elevator - Angular, Right and Left Set | 400.00 | 20,000.00 | 400.00 | 20,000.00 | Surgent (German Steel) | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 60 | piece | Forcep - Type: Adult #16 | 897.00 | 53,820.00 | 550.00 | 33,000.00 | Surgent (German Steel) | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 40 | box | Gel Foam - 20 cubes/box | 633.00 | 25,320.00 | 380.00 | 15,200.00 | Surgent (German Steel) | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 100 | piece | Gum Separator - Dental | 95.00 | 9,500.00 | 65.00 | 6,500.00 | Surgent (German Steel) | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 150 | piece | Hand Instrument - Cotton Plier | 95.00 | 14,250.00 | 65.00 | 9,750.00 | Surgent (German Steel) | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 100 | piece | Hand Instrument - Explorer | 95.00 | 9,500.00 | 65.00 | 6,500.00 | Surgent (German Steel) | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |

| Item | QTY | Unit | Description | ABC ITEM | ABC Total | MALYKA INTERNATIONAL TRADING INC. | | | MONES DENTAL LABORATORY | | |
|------|-----|-------|--|----------|-----------|-----------------------------------|-----------|------------------------|-------------------------|--------|------------------|
| | | | | | | Unit Cost | Amount | Remarks | Unit Cost | Amount | Remarks |
| | 100 | piece | Hand Instrument - Spoon Excavator | 95.00 | 9,500.00 | 65.00 | 6,500.00 | Surgent (German Steel) | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 100 | piece | Hand Instrument - Woodson | 95.00 | 9,500.00 | 65.00 | 6,500.00 | Surgent (German Steel) | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 150 | piece | Mouth Mirror - Mouth Mirror, w/ Handle | 111.00 | 16,650.00 | 75.00 | 11,250.00 | Surgent (German Steel) | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 150 | piece | Mouth Mirror - No. 50 w/o Handle | 52.00 | 7,800.00 | 38.00 | 5,700.00 | Surgent (German Steel) | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | | | Purpose: For 2022 1st semester dental supplies c/o Dental, HSO. Bidders MALYKA INTERNATIONAL TRADING INC. MONES DENTAL LABORATORY | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | Passed | | | Failed | | |
| | | | | | | | | | | | |

Item
1 Lot

Awarded to:

MALYKA INTERNATIONAL TRADING INC.



January 25, 2022
ATTY. LETICIA O. CLEMENTE
 City Budget Officer
 & BAC Chairperson



January 25, 2022
MR. EUGENE D. BUYUCAN
 City General Services Officer
 & BAC Vice Chair Person



January 25, 2022
DR. SILARDO B. BESTED
 D.V.N, Assistant City Veterinarian
 & BAC Member



January 25, 2022
Dr. Rowena P. Galpo
 City Health Officer
 & Enduser



January 25, 2022
ATTY. RHENAN G. DIWAS
 City Environment and Parks Management Officer
 & BAC Member



January 25, 2022
ATTY. ALTHEA ROSANNA V. ALBERTO
 Executive Assistant IV
 & BAC Member



January 25, 2022
ATTY. RICHARD G. DAYAG
 City Legal Officer
 & BAC Member

| Item | QTY | Unit | Description | ABC ITEM | ABC Total | WISENHEIMER TRADING | | |
|------|-----|-------|--|------------|------------|---------------------|--------|------------------|
| | | | | | | Unit Cost | Amount | Remarks |
| 1 | 1 | Lot | Dental supplies c/o HSO | 245,215.00 | 245,215.00 | 0.00 | | |
| | 25 | piece | Dental Elevator - Size: Medium Shape, Type: Straight | 460.00 | 11,500.00 | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 25 | box | Dental Needle - Gauge 30 | 728.00 | 18,200.00 | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 25 | box | Dental Needle - Hypodermic Needle Disposable, 27G 1/2inch (0.40x13mm) | 437.00 | 10,925.00 | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 50 | piece | Dental Syringe - 1.8ml Self Aspirating Dental Syringe | 575.00 | 28,750.00 | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 50 | set | Elevator - Angular, Right and Left Set | 400.00 | 20,000.00 | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 60 | piece | Forcep - Type: Adult #16 | 897.00 | 53,820.00 | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 40 | box | Gel Foam - 20 cubes/box | 633.00 | 25,320.00 | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 100 | piece | Gum Separator - Dental | 95.00 | 9,500.00 | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 150 | piece | Hand Instrument - Cotton Plier | 95.00 | 14,250.00 | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 100 | piece | Hand Instrument - Explorer | 95.00 | 9,500.00 | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 100 | piece | Hand Instrument - Spoon Excavator | 95.00 | 9,500.00 | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 100 | piece | Hand Instrument - Woodson | 95.00 | 9,500.00 | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 150 | piece | Mouth Mirror - Mouth Mirror, w/ Handle | 111.00 | 16,650.00 | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | 150 | piece | Mouth Mirror - No. 50 w/o Handle | 52.00 | 7,800.00 | 0.00 | 0.00 | No bid submitted |
| | | | Purpose: For 2022 1st semester dental supplies c/o Dental, HSO. | | | | | |
| | | | Bidders WISENHEIMER TRADING | | | | | |
| | | | | | | Failed | | |
| | | | | | | | | |

Item
1 Lot

Awarded to:

MALYKA INTERNATIONAL TRADING INC.



January 25, 2022
ATTY. LETICIA O. CLEMENTE
City Budget Officer
& BAC Chairperson



January 25, 2022
MR. EUGENE D. BUYUCAN
City General Services Officer
& BAC Vice Chair Person



January 25, 2022
DR. SILARDO B. BESTED
D.V.N, Assistant City Veterinarian
& BAC Member



January 25, 2022
Dr. Rowena P. Galpo
City Health Officer
& Enduser



January 25, 2022
ATTY. RHENAN G. DIWAS
City Environment and Parks Management Officer
& BAC Member



January 25, 2022
ATTY. ALTHEA ROSANNA V. ALBERTO
Executive Assistant IV
& BAC Member



January 25, 2022
ATTY. RICHARD G. DAYAG
City Legal Officer
& BAC Member