Republic of the Philippines WERAL‘SEL(ES'Q;FE
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

(Goods and Services) ] 12 MAY 2022 ‘
Baguio City | S |
Abstract of Bid or quotation under Circular Proposal No. NP SVP598, Project ID: 40561,PR No:538 opened on May_ 06, 2022 and date prepared May 06, 2022 | BAGU'O CI
tem | QTY | Unit Description ABC ABC Total Larry's Alrconditioning a;r-__ JSD AUTOSPORT PARTS TRADING &
ITEM Engineering Services SERVICES
Unit Cost Amount Remarks Unit Cost Amount Remarks
1 1 Lot RM Vehicle- SJV 136 c/o OCSWDO 92,550.00 | 92,550.00 103,500.00 76,130.00
1 set - Brake Pad - Brand new/Replacement 2,300.00 2,300.00 2,400.00 2,400.00 2,150.00 2,150.00 Bendix
1 set - Brake Shoe - Brand new/Replacement 3,800.00 3,800.00 4,000.00 4,000.00 2,800.00 2,800.00 Bendix
1 set - Clutch Pedal Assembly - Brand new/Replacement 2,800.00 2,800.00 2,900.00 2,900.00 2,800.00 2,800.00
1 lot - Labor 18,450.00 | 18,450.00 | 20,000.00 | 20,000.00 16,000.00 | 16,000.00
2 piece | - Lower Ball Joint - Brand new/Replacement 2,000.00 4,000.00 2,500.00 5,000.00 1,950.00 3,900.00 555
1 piece | - Lower Bushing - Brand new/Replacement 800.00 800.00 1,000.00 1,000.00 650.00 650.00 JAG
1 set - Primary Clutch - Brand new/Replacement 3,600.00 3,600.00 4,500.00 4,500.00 2,500.00 2,500.00 Aisin
2 piece | - Rack End - Brand new/Replacement 2,000.00 4,000.00 3,000.00 6,000.00 1,550.00 3,100.00 555
1 piece | - Rotor Disc - Brand new/Replacement 13,000.00 | 13,000.00 | 15,000.00 15,000.00 11,000.00 11,000.00 Powerplus
4 piece | - Shock Absorber frant and back - Brand new/Replacement 2,000.00 8,000.00 2,500.00 10,000.00 1,700.00 6,800.00 KYB
1 piece | - Spring Bushing Back - Brand new/Replacement 800.00 800.00 1,200.00 1,200.00 650.00 650.00 JAG
1 piece | - Stabilizer Bushing - Brand new/Replacement 1,400.00 1,400.00 1,500.00 1,500.00 980.00 980.00 JAG
1 piece | - Stabilizer Link - Brand new/Replacement 3,500.00 3,500.00 4,500.00 4,500.00 2,550.00 2,550.00 555
1 piece | - Strut Bar Bushing - Brand new/Replacement 1,500.00 1,500.00 2,500.00 2,500.00 650.00 650.00 JAG




ltem [ QTY | Unit Description ABC ABC Total Larry's Airconditioning and JSD AUTOSPORT PARTS TRADING &
ITEM Engineering Services SERVICES
Unit Cost Amount Remarks Unit Cost Amount Remarks
2 piece | - Tie Rod End - Brand new/Replacement 2,500.00 5,000.00 1,500.00 3,000.00 1,550.00 3,100.00 555
1 piece | - Upper Arm Suspension - Brand new/Replacement 19,600.00 | 19,600.00 | 20,000.00 20,000.00 16,500.00 16,500.00 | Dura
‘ Purpose: For the repair of government service vehicle Toyota Commuter Van with
f ol plate No. SJV 136.
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' Larry’s Airconditioning and Engineering Services
JSD AUTOSPORT PARTS TRADING & SERVICES
Failed Passed
Above ABC
ltem _ i Signed
1Lot ; /ﬂ/k N May 11, 2022
Liza D. Bulayungan
Awarded to: May 10, 2022 May 10, 2022 May 10, 2022 City Social We'fa‘: Q::U':::'empme"‘ OiESE
ATTY. LETICIA O. CLEMENTE MR. EUGENE D. BUYUCAN DR. SILARDO B. BESTED
P \'
458 RUTASFORT RARTS TRADING S SERVICES City Budget Officer City General Services Officer D.V.M, City Veterinarian
& BAC Chairperson & BAC Vice Chair Person & BAC Member
) May 10, 2022
ATTY. RICHARD G. DAYAG
City Legal Officer
May 10, 2022 s
ay 10, 202 May. 10,2022 & BAC Member

ATTY. RHENAN G. DIWAS

City Environment and Parks Management Officer

& BAC Member

ATTY. ALTHEA ROSANNA V. ALBERTO

Executive Assistant IV

& BAC Member
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May 10, 2022 May 10, 2022 May 10, 2022
SARTETRAE [T ATTY, LETICIA O. CLEMENTE MR. EUGENE D. BUYUCAN DR. SILARDO B. BESTED
B :“ARTS 1] G & SERVICES City Budget Officer City Genera} Services Officer D.V.M, City Veterinarian
g = & BAC Chairperson & BAC Vice Chair Person & BAC Member
May 10, 2022 May 10, 2022

ATTY. ALTHEA ROSANNA V. ALBERTO

and Parks M. Officer Executive Assistant IV

City Envil

& BAC Member & BAC Member

tem Qry Unit Description ABC ITEM ABC Total AUTOBASE AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES & PARTS
Unit Cost Amount Remarks
1 1 Lot RM Vehicle- SJV 136 clo OCSWDO 92,550.00 92,550.00 0.00

1 set - Brake Pad - Brand new/Replacement 2,300.00 2,300.00 0.00 0.00 No bid submitted
1 set - Brake Shoe - Brand new/Replacement 3,800.00 3,800.00 0.00 0.00 No bid submitted
1 set - Clutch Pedal Assembly - Brand new/Replacement 2,800.00 2,800.00 0,00 0.00 No bid submitted
1 lot - Labor 18,450.00 18,450.00 0.00 0.00 No bid submitted
2 piece - Lower Ball Joint - Brand new/Replacement 2,000.00 4,000.00 0.00 0.00 No bid submitted
1 piece - Lower Bushing - Brand new/Replacement 800.00 800.00 0.00 0.00 No bid submitted
1 set - Primary Clutch - Brand new/Replacement 3,600.00 3,600.00 0.00 0.00 No bid submitted

- Rack End - Brand new/Replacement 2,000.00 4,000.00 0.00 0.00 No bid submitted

t Rotor Disc - Brand new/Replacement 13,000.00 13,000.00 0.00 0.00 No bid submitted

- Shock Absorber front and back - Brand new/Replacement 2,000.00 8,000.00 0.00 0.00 No bid submitted
1 piece - Spring Bushing Back - Brand new/Replacement 800.00 800.00 0.00 0.00 No bid submitted
1 piece - Stabilizer Bushing - Brand new/Replacement 1,400.00 1,400.00 0.00 0.00 No bid submiited
1 piece - Stabilizer Link - Brand new/Replacement 3,500.00 3,500.00 0.00 0.00 No bid submitted
1 piece ~ Strut Bar Bushing - Brand new/Replacement 1,500.00 1,500.00 0.00 0.00 No bid submitted
2 piece - Tie Rod End - Brand new/Replacement 2,500.00 5,000.00 0.00 0.00 No bid submitted
1 piece - Upper Arm Suspension - Brand new/Repl: 19,600.00 19,600.00 0.00 0.00 No bid submitted

Purpose: For the repair of government service vehicle Toyota Commuter Van with plate No. SJV 136.

Bidders

AUTOBASE AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES & PARTS

Failed
. Signed
May 11, 2022

Liza D. Bulayungan
City Soclat Welfare And Development Officer
& Enduser

May 10, 2022
ATTY. RICHARD G. DAYAG
City Legal Officer
& BAC Member




